
Leadership is not about the prestige 

of your title but about the quality of 

your character.       

 

Understand that, at the end of the 

day, leadership is all about 

relationships. 

 

People will not follow you                            

if they do not trust you. 

 

“The very essence of leadership is 

that you have to have vision.  You 

can’t blow an uncertain trumpet.”                                             

- Theodore M. Hesburgh 

 

“You do not lead by hitting people 

over the head – that’s assault, not 

leadership.  - Dwight D. Eisenhower 

 

“I suppose leadership at one time 

meant muscles; but today it means 

getting along with people.                                        

– Mohandas Gandhi 

 

“Good leaders must first become 

good servants.”     - Robert Greenleaf 

 

“Blessed is the leader who seeks the 

best for those he serves.”              

“Leader aren’t born they are made.  

And they are made just like anything 

else, through hard work.                         

– Vince Lombardi 

 

Be gentle and you can be bold; be 

frugal and you can be liberal; avoid 

putting yourself before others and 

you can become a leader among 

men.”     -Lao Tzu 

 

“No man will ever make a great leader 

who wants to do it all himself or get 

all the credit for doing it.”                                              

-Andrew Carnegie 

 

“There is no man living who isn’t 

capable of doing more than he thinks 

he can do.”     - Henry Ford 

 

“If your actions inspire others to 

dream more, learn more, do more 

and become more, you are a leader.”    

- John Quincy Adams 

 

“The final test of a leader is that he 

leaves behind him in other men the 

conviction and will to carry on.”                                            

- Walter Lippman 

 



To handle yourself, use your head;    
to handle others, use your heart.           

- Eleanor Roosevelt 
  

A leader is someone willing to give 
his strength to others that they may 
have the strength to stand on their 

own. - Beth Revis 
  

A leader takes people where they 
want to go. A great leader takes 

people where they don't necessarily 
want to go, but ought to be.                    

- Rosalynn Carter 
  
The ultimate measure of a man is not 

where he stands in moments of 
comfort, but where he stands at times 

of challenge and controversy.                
- Martin Luther King, Jr. 

  
Change will not come if we wait for 
some other person or some other 
time.  We are the ones we've been 

waiting for. -President Barack Obama 
  
A very great vision is needed and the 
man who has it must follow it as the 
eagle seeks the deepest blue of the 

sky. – Crazy Horse 
  

When I dare to be powerful – to use 
my strength in the service of my 

vision, then it becomes less and less 
important whether I am afraid.             

- Audre Lorde 
  
The teacher… does not bid you enter 
the house of his wisdom, but rather 
leads you to the threshold of your 

own mind…                                                   
- Kahlil Gibran, The Prophet 

  

I start with the premise that the 
function of a leader is to produce 
more leaders, not more followers.        

- Ralph Nader 
  
  

Talk is cheap…  But it is the way we 
organize and use our lives every day 
that reveals what we truly believe in. 

– Cesar Chavez 
 

Power is like being a lady…, If you 
have to tell people you are,                

you aren’t.                                                                
– Margaret Thatcher 

 
People, even more than things, have 

to be restored, renewed, revived, 
reclaimed, and redeemed; never 

throw out anyone. – Audrey Hepburn 
 

If you cannot feed a hundred people, 
then feed just one. 

-Mother Teresa 
 

Our emerging workforce is not 
interested in command-and-control 

leadership. They don’t want to do 
things because I said so; they want to 

do things because they want to do 
them. – Irene Rosenfeld, CEO 

 
Leadership is about making others 
better as a result of your presence, 

and making sure that impact lasts in 
your absence. – Sheryl Sandberg,COO 

Facebook 
 

If you are successful, it is because 
somewhere, sometime, someone gave 
you a life or an idea that started you 
in the right direction. – Melinda Gates 
 

 


